

Alameda Co-op Bid 2015-16

Vendor Awarded

Item Description	Pack Size	Award Price	Vendor Awarded	Not Bid by P&R
ALCOHOL PROBE WIPES	10 /100 CT	\$15.95	P&R	46
APRON, POLY EMBROSSED WHITE, 28" X 46" ECONOMY	10 /100 CT	\$28.50	P&R	86
BAGS, BROWN GROCERY #6	500/CS	\$7.20	P&R	54
BAG BUN RACK COVER 52 X 80 REFERENCE BRAND: FOOD HANDLER SB52D OR EQUAL	50/CS	\$11.50	P&R	40
BAG BUN PAN, HI DENSITY CLEAR, 27" X 37" REFERENCE BRAND: FOOD HANDLER OR EQUAL	200/CS	\$12.05	P&R	50
BAG PLASTIC PRODUCE 11x14 LOW DENSITY IF ALTERNATE SIZE, PLEASE SPECIFY	4/500/CS	\$14.40	P&R	0
BAG, POLY SANDWICH, HI DENSITY CLEAR, 7.5" X 7" REFERENCE BRAND: HANDGUARD 303679580	2000/CS	\$7.55	P&R	70
BOX, PIZZA SLICE, WHITE 16/8	400/CS	\$45.95	P&R	45
CLEANER GLASS/MULTIPURPOSE (disinfectant)	6/32 OZ	\$28.40	P&R	0
CONTAINER, CLEAR FLAT HINGED, 24 oz	200/CS	\$28.90	P&R	15
CONTAINER PAPER, ROUND w/LID 8 oz Serene# 71689	250/CS	\$31.95	P&R	75
CONTAINER , FOOD, WHITE , 8OZ	1M/CS	\$29.15	P&R	0
CUP, PORTION, PLASTIC, 2 oz SOLO or Sweetheart	2M/CS	\$19.25	P&R	90
CUP, PORTION, PLASTIC, 4 oz SOLO or Sweetheart	2M/CS	\$31.55	P&R	75
CUP, PORTION, PLASTIC, 5.5 oz SOLO #151323	2500/CS	\$45.55	P&R	60

DELIMER DESCALER LIME A WAY REFERENCE BRAND: KEYSTONE	2/1 GAL	\$32.24	SYSCO	0	x
DETERGENT FOR POT/PAN CREAM SUDS	50#/CS	\$94.50	P&R	65	
DISPOSABLE FULL 2" PAN FOIL (STM TBL)	50/CS	\$31.90	P&R	0	
FILM CLING NON-PERF 18" X 2000'	ROLL	\$10.95	P&R	25	
FILM ALUMINUM HEAVY DUTY 18" X 1000'	ROLL	\$35.65	P&R	97	
FOIL CUSHION , 10.5 " X 14"	4/500	\$52.40	P&R	124	
FOIL HEAVY DUTY, 18" X 1000"	ROLL	\$35.65	P&R	16	
FOIL POP UP SHEETS 9" X 10.75" PAC-TIV W72	3M/CS	\$34.85	P&R	56	
GLOVES KNIT WHITE STRING LARGE	12/PKG	\$4.15	P&R	2	
GLOVES, HEAVY DUTY ORANGE DISHWASHING, LARGE	12/12 CT	\$5.20	P&R	39	
HAIRNETS, DARK BROWN, LARGE SIZE	10/144 CT	\$88.90	P&R	37	
HAIRNETS, LITE BROWN, LARGE SIZE	10/144 CT	\$88.90	P&R	2	
HAIRNETS WHITE GAUZE 21" BOUFFANT CAP	1M/CS	\$19.95	P&R	10	
INSERTS, PARFAIT CUPS, CLEAR	1M/CS	\$33.90	P&R	55	
LIDS, FLAT NO OPENING for 16 OZ PARFAIT CUP	1M/CS	\$19.90	P&R	55	
LIDS, FLAT for 8 OZ FOOD CONTAINER	1M/CS	\$16.80	P&R	35	
LIDS, PLASTIC, FLAT, 2 oz PORTION CUPS	2M/CS	\$19.05	P&R	40	
LIDS, PLASTIC, CLEAR FLAT, 3.25 - 5.5 oz PORTION CUPS SOLO #151332	2500/CS	\$34.00	P&R	25	
LINER PAN 17" X 25"	1M/CS	\$25.35	P&R	275	

LINER PAN 19-3/8" X 27-3/8"	1M/CS	\$72.50	P&R	97	
LUNCH BOX with HANDLE, CLEAR , 7 3/4" x 7 1/2" x 3 9/16"	100/CS	\$32.55	P&R	27	
NAPKIN RE-FILL FOR XPRESS DISPENSER "NATURAL"	6M/CS	\$38.75	P&R	110	
NAPKIN DISPENSER FOLDED WHITE 8X13	10M/CS	\$20.75	P&R	40	
PAIL FOOD, WIRELESS, PAGODA DESIGN, 16 oz	9/50 CT	\$24.70	P&R	95	
PAN GRABBER, KNIT, 8.5" X 11"	3/PK	\$25.00	P&R	0	
PLATE BIODEGRADABLE 6". SAMPLE REQUIRED FOR BID TO BE CONSIDERED	1M/CS	\$27.40	P&R	7	
PLATE BIODEGRADABLE 9". SAMPLE REQUIRED FOR BID TO BE CONSIDERED	500/CS	\$26.45	P&R	10	
PLATE OVAL BIODEGRADABLE 7.5" X 10" CHINET PAPER PRO-NATURALS ONLY	500/CS	\$40.95	P&R	0	
POT HOLDER 8 X 8 W/LOOP 100% COTTON UP TO 300F	6/PKG	\$1.75	P&R	23	
SCOUR PAD GREEN 6 X 9	60/CS	\$10.35	P&R	48	
SCOUR PAD STAINLESS STEEL	12/CS	\$3.65	P&R	25	
SHEETS, PVC, 15" x 15"	1100/roll	\$10.85	P&R	30	
SPORK KIT 5.5" REG STRAW/NAPKIN	1M/CS	\$11.15	P&R	2100	
SPORK MEDIUM POLYPROPYLENE, SAMPLE IS REQUIRED ON ALL BIDS	1000/CS	\$5.35	P&R	200	
STRAW BIODEGRADABLE JUMBO I.W. 7.75"	4/500CS	\$20.55	P&R	20	
TAPE, GREEN 3/8" X 180 YARDS	1 EA	\$2.75	P&R	10	
THERMOMETER FOR RFGR/FRZR -40 TO 120F HANGS OR MOUNTED	1 EA	\$2.85	P&R	150	
TRAY, PAPER, 5 " X 8" X 2" REFERENCE BRAND: GOLDEN WEST CN582	500/CS	\$14.20	P&R	2405	

TRAY BLACK BIODEGRADABLE 12" ROUND. SABERT#: 9912SY NO SUBSTITUTE	36/CS	\$29.00	SYSCO	1	x
TRAY, FOOD, 2# KRAFTBACK	1M/CS	\$13.95	P&R	60	
TRAY, FOOD, 3# KRAFTBACK	1M/CS	\$12.10	P&R	0	
TRAY, FOOD, 5# KRAFTBACK	1M/CS	\$16.25	P&R	0	
TRAY BLACK BIODEGRADABLE 18" ROUND. SABERT#: 9918SY NO SUBSTITUTE	36/CS	\$59.55	SYSCO	5	x
DOME LID BIODEGRADABLE 12" MUST FIT 12" SABERT TRAY#: 5512SY	36/CS	\$22.73	SYSCO	1	x
DOME LID BIODEGRADABLE 18" MUST FIT 18" SABERT TRAY#: 5518SY	36/CS	\$39.55	SYSCO	5	x
TRAY PAPER 1 COMPARTMENT BIODEGRADABLE SABERT#: 46120F - 9" X 6.75" 300/cs or	500/CS	\$34.90	P&R	20	
UTENSIL FORK-KNIFE-SPOON PAK BIODEGRADABLE. TRELIS ONLY	250/CS	\$44.18	SYSCO	0	x
UTENSIL FORK MEDIUM 6" BULK BIODEGRADABLE. TRELIS ONLY	1M/CS	\$42.94	SYSCO	205	x
UTENSIL KNIFE MEDIUM 6" BULK BIODEGRADABLE. TRELIS ONLY	1M/CS	\$31.00	SYSCO	36	x
UTENSIL SPOON MEDIUM 6" BULK BIODEGRADABLE. TRELIS ONLY	1M/CS	\$31.00	SYSCO	110	x
UTENSIL FORK PLASTIC RE-FILL FOR: SMARTSTOCK DIXIE DISPENSER	960/CS	\$20.50	P&R	0	
WRAP FILM POLY COLD 19"	30#/ROLL		NO BID	0	x
WRAP FILM POLY HOT 14"	30#/ROLL		NO BID	0	x
WRAP FILM POLY HOT 14.5"	30#/ROLL		NO BID	0	x
WRAP CUSH FOIL PAPER, 10-1/2" X 14" ONLY, WITH COLORED DESIGNS, BLUE, GOLD & GREEN ONLY. PAPERCON OR EQUAL	2M/CS	\$52.40	P&R	20	
WRAP, PAPER MEAT WHITE 1300 FT, 15 "	1 ROLL	\$17.45	P&R	0	
WRAP PICK-UP FLAT BAKERY TISSUE 6" X 6" PAPERCON T66	20/1M/CS	\$61.55	P&R	10	

WRAP PICK-UP FLAT BAKERY TISSUE 6" X 10.75"	10/1M/CS	\$36.55	P&R	0	
WRAP WAX DRY TISSUE 12" X 12"	5M/CS	\$38.45	P&R	0	
NEW ITEMS - CLEANING SUPPLIES (ECOLAB)					
Crème Cleanser	6/32oz.	\$23.98	SYSCO	0	X
DigiClean Antib. Hand Soap E	6/750ml	\$58.42	SYSCO	0	X
Dishwasher Label Temp Sensor Ecolab	24ct	\$22.14	SYSCO	40	X
EcoSan Machine Sanitizer E	4/1 gallon	\$21.84	SYSCO	0	X
Gel Pro 50	12/16oz.	\$49.51	SYSCO	0	X
Glass Cleaner Windex	6/32oz.	\$52.50	P&R	0	
Lime a Way E	4/1gal	\$32.84	SYSCO	15	X
Liquid Satin Sheen	6/1qt	\$41.06	SYSCO	0	X
Machine Solid Metal Pro E	4/8#	\$85.24	SYSCO	0	X
Pan Dandy Deter. Hand Liq. E	5 gal	\$45.57	SYSCO	0	X
Pan Dandy Deter. Hand Liq. E	4/1 gal	\$40.38	SYSCO	0	X
Rinse Aid Jet Dry E	4/1gal	\$76.13	SYSCO	0	X
Rinse Solid Additive - APEX #16811 E	1/2.5#	\$98.25	SYSCO	0	X
Sanitizer Quat Oasis 146 Multi E	1/ 2.5g	\$59.93	SYSCO	10	X
Solid Super Impact E	1cs/4caps		NO BID	0	X
Spray Bottles w/nozzle	3/24oz	\$2.30	SYSCO	10	X

Ster Back Blu	4/1gal		NO BID	0	x
Ultra Dry E	4/1 gal	\$111.18	SYSCO	10	x
Ultra Kleen E	4/1 gal	\$72.64	SYSCO	10	x
New Item Add Ons					
PAR PAK					
Salad Bowl - 16oz Invisi-Bowl®, Black 5MO16-PB-BK	450/cs	\$42.00	P&R	50	
Flat Lid for 16oz & 24oz 5M200-PD	450/cs	\$37.00	P&R	40	
Small Combo Black Base Clear Lid Clamshell #21121	250/cs	\$39.00	P&R	20	
Pactiv ClearView® SmartLock® 9" Hoagie Package ITEM # PCA-YCI81049	200/cs	\$34.00	P&R	50	
Karat® Clear Dome Lid Fits 12 oz. - 24 oz. PET Cold Cup LLC-KDL626NH	1000/cs	\$19.90	P&R	25	
16oz Clear Plastic Cup TP16D Solo	1000/cs	\$45.00	P&R	10	
12oz Parfait/Fruit Salad Cup - NetChoice 116298	1000/cs	\$41.45	P&R	10	
Parfait Granola Insert - Sabert 3.5in 4oz PET Insert for 12oz cup 14003D1000	1000/cs	\$33.90	P&R	25	
Lid for Parfait Cup, No Straw cut - 662TP	1000/cs	\$18.90	P&R	0	
ANC -4604810 10 OZ. Black Bowl	500/cs	\$39.90	P&R	20	
CUB-CR927B Black Rectangle Micro	150	\$41.40	P&R	37	
GWP-KB300 3# Kraftback Food Tray	500cs.	\$12.10	P&R	300	
SPK-CHIC843 8' Hoagie Cont-hinged	250	\$32.05	P&R	25	
Plastic Cover 54 x 108 White HOF 11200	12/cs	\$19.00	P&R	10	

Parfait Kit - 12oz cup, insert and lid	500/cs	\$66.55	P&R	14	
7oz DP Papercup-Champagne	2500/cs	\$55.55	P&R	0	